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2.2 - Catering to Student Diversity 
2.2.1 - The institution assesses students’ learning levels and organizes special 
programmes for both slow and advanced learners. 

 
Educating the under-privileged or first-generation learners is a matter of 

pride for Prananth College (Autonomous), Khordha which also taught us to make 
provisions to devise graded student assessment and adopt remedial courses for 
assisting students in every Department/Centre. The College ordinance states that 
“Internal Assessment in a theory course may comprise of written tests, 
assignments, presentations, seminars, tutorials, term papers etc. as prescribed by 
the concerned Board of Studies/Committee of Studies from time to time”, giving 
autonomy to the departments, to provide options for aiding weak students. This led 
Continuous Internal Assessment to monitor and assess the progress of students. 

 
Some department have consultation hour (non-credited), as a part of regular 

time table to consult with teachers. 
 
Students are also provided an option of online feedback about curriculum 

and teacher’s evaluation so that suitable improvements can be made. 
 
Tutorial classes are included in the teaching schedules, wherein opportunity 

to both advanced and slow learners are provided. 
 
Special classes/practical/tutorials are organized by departments to address 

specific needs of such students. Subject association is active in all departments. 
Weekly discussions, Journal clubs, Screenings of You tubes, Group discussions, 
Open debates are organized for augmenting learning outside the classroom. 

 
Extension lectures, capability enhancement programs are organized at 

departments and occasionally at College level for motivation, personality 
development, leadership training, confidence-building, with interaction with 
experts/ intellectuals. 

 
Extension lectures by experts are arranged on mental health and life skills as 

well. Many departments, especially Science and computer science and electronics, 
have summer internships, dissertation projects (with industry, R&D laboratories, 
other Universities) as part of their curricula. Faculties of Social Sciences, 
Humanities and Arts provide for field work for projects and dissertations. Since 
implementation of CBCS courses, every Department/ Centre appoints a 
coordinator, to mentor students and to provide personalized and regular support in 
selection of proper courses based on their aptitude, need and interest. 
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Hand holding of fresher’s by senior students has been a practice to help them 
cope with their studies and personal realm, which impacts their overall 
performance/well-being. Department also organizes orientation sessions for 
students to guide them about various curricular and co-curricular programs and 
program outcomes. In some departments, students have options to answer their 
assignments/exams in language of their choice. 
  

Students Welfare extends all support to students, which includes 
opportunities of scholarships, fellowships, awards, club memberships (Green 
Volunteers, Quality Volunteers), College activities etc. They are urged to 
participate in diverse curricular and co-curricular forums like seminars, 
conferences, lectures, as well as other literary events, cultural events, various club 
activities in the domains of art, dance, theatre, music, and other performing arts 
organized from time to time. Several workshops and lectures are organized. on 
education, poverty, healthcare, excessive urbanization, digitalization of villages, 
energy and environment etc. 

 
 


